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"An engaging and dramatic look at the dark side of living the high life. A refreshing addition to the thriller
genre." - Foreword Clarion Reviews

"The scenery, food, and wine, coupled with a burgeoning love affair, create an appealing sense of
joy." -- Kirkus Reviews

In this tale of corporate skullduggery and mystical awakening, a multibillionaire decides to radically
alter his course and seek a clearer path to happiness.

For New Yorker Nick Dalca wealth is a birthright, but his perfect life is starting to crumble around him. His
private jet? Missing. Wife and son? Presumed dead. Having no one left to continue his family legacy, Nick
makes a shocking decision: negotiating the future of his business conglomerate, a sale which may turn him
into the richest man in the world.

Threats to his plan begin to emerge with the scent of corruption and extortion. All alone, he becomes closer
to his longtime secretary, Anne. Apparently she can talk to dead people. While Nick's pragmatism is tested,
he is stunned to find there is a higher power hidden within himself. In order to learn about the fate of his
family Nick will talk to anyone from hell or heaven--whichever comes first.
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From reader reviews:

Antoine Dejean:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled A Higher Power. Try to stumble through book A Higher Power as
your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you experience alone and beside regarding course
make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you much more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and knowledge
with this book.

Stacey Williams:

The reason? Because this A Higher Power is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for
you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside of easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this
nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have
got such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold up having
that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Gladys Jackson:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled A
Higher Power your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
not known for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a publication
then become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get ahead of. The A Higher
Power giving you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful
details for your better life on this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here is your body and
mind will probably be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try
this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Andre Smith:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in the
top collection in your reading list is definitely A Higher Power. This book that is qualified as The Hungry
Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking up and review this book you can
get many advantages.
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