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The time around 1800 was a fascinating period of transition, of endings and new beginnings in all aspects of
life: intellectually, socially, economically and politically. It was the time of the French Revolution, the fall of
the Habsburg Empire (1806), secularization, the Napoleonic Wars, the Restoration. In the art of drawing,
which was the "signature" of that era, contemporary changes in society could be found more subtly than in
other genres. In the literary age of Goethe, the most influential artists produced masterpieces in the field of
drawing, and many others devoted themselves to that genre exclusively. "Fuseli to Menzel" contains a
selection of works by 47 artists from the late 18th and early 19th centuries representing Romanticism and
other artistic trends of the period. The book presents new scholarly research and material, including
illustrations which have never been published before and detailed biographies. The author focuses on
landscapes, particularly on the artists' experience of Italy, and on portraits, especially self-portraits and
portraits of other artists. Exquisite quality, vivid imagination, intellectual complexity and artistic perception
characterize the watercolours and drawings presented here in this visually stunning volume.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Evans:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and Watercolors in the Age of Goethe. Try to
make the book Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and Watercolors in the Age of Goethe as your good friend. It
means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you
smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you considerably more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience and
also knowledge with this book.

Norman Fuentes:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
if those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one
would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then you
buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and Watercolors in the Age of Goethe as
your daily resource information.

Jeanie Clark:

This book untitled Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and Watercolors in the Age of Goethe to be one of several
books in which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit
in it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this e-book from your list.

Edward Doucet:

The book Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and Watercolors in the Age of Goethe will bring one to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Fuseli to Menzel: Drawings and
Watercolors in the Age of Goethe is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.
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