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John Santrock’s Educational Psychology emphasizes the application of theory to real classroom practice.
With richly evocative classroom vignettes from practicing teachers and a wealth of case studies, Educational
Psychology helps students think critically about the research basis for best practices. Santrock’s hallmark
Learning System organizes the content into manageable chunks under learning goals, supporting retention
and mastery, so that students will have an engaging and successful course experience.

Instructors and students can now access their course content through the Connect digital learning platform by
purchasing either standalone Connect access or a bundle of print and Connect access. McGraw-Hill
Connect® is a subscription-based learning service accessible online through your personal computer or
tablet. Choose this option if your instructor will require Connect to be used in the course. Your subscription
to Connect includes the following:

• SmartBook® - an adaptive digital version of the course textbook that personalizes your reading experience
based on how well you are learning the content.
• Access to your instructor’s homework assignments, quizzes, syllabus, notes, reminders, and other important
files for the course.
• Progress dashboards that quickly show how you are performing on your assignments and tips for
improvement.
• The option to purchase (for a small fee) a print version of the book. This binder-ready, loose-leaf version
includes free shipping.

Complete system requirements to use Connect can be found here:
http://www.mheducation.com/highered/platforms/connect/training-support-students.html
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From reader reviews:

Kathie Richmond:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading
a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will want this Looseleaf for Educational Psychology.

Deborah Hart:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an individual is
you don't know what type you should start with. This Looseleaf for Educational Psychology is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in
this era.

John Lockett:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader with their
story or their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about the data about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones, there
are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some analysis before they write with their book. One of them is this Looseleaf for
Educational Psychology.

Barbara Kyle:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Looseleaf for Educational Psychology can be the
solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in
this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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