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David James is smart, successful, handsome... and alone. After the death of his lover, Kyle, from cancer, he
buried himself in his law practice and the gym. At forty-eight, he is haunted by his memories and walled off
from the world. When David injures himself working out, he's assigned to Brandon Smith for physical
therapy. The vibrant young therapist is attracted to David and realizes he needs a hand to get back into
dating. What begins as a practice coffee date escalates to friendship, passion, and maybe something more, as
they navigate a new relationship in Washington, DC, and the gay mecca of Provincetown.

But David remains trapped behind the barrier of fear and guilt. Will he remain loyal to Kyle's memory if he
moves on? Can he and Brandon manage a twenty-two-year age gap? Brandon thinks he understands David's
concerns, and for him, the answer to those questions is yes. He wants to be with David, and he believes he
can overcome David's barriers. But Brandon fails to account for the world's reaction to a handsome young
man attached to an older, wealthy lover. David's memories, Brandon's pride, and an unexpected tragedy
might cost them something very special.
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From reader reviews:

James Collis:

This September (Pride and Joy) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you have by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get info
which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This specific September (Pride and
Joy) without we recognize teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing.
Don't possibly be worry September (Pride and Joy) can bring if you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This
September (Pride and Joy) having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

John Carter:

This book untitled September (Pride and Joy) to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this book in
the book retailer or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no
reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Maria Lamotte:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a book. The book September (Pride and Joy) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough
space to create this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from
the smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book features high quality.

Christina Webb:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of
many books in the top record in your reading list is actually September (Pride and Joy). This book which can
be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking
upwards and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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