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Edward IV, (1442-1483) was King of England from 4 March 1461 until 3 October 1470, and again from 11
April 1471 until his death on 9 April 1483. In a turbulent world marred by civil war, Edward, 4th Duke of
York?with good title to the throne?overthrew the corrupt government of the weak and feeble-minded Henry
VI, setting the foundation stones for a strong and prosperous England. He was an able and successful king
who rescued England from the misery of war and created her with a firm, judicious and popular government.
Like his grandson, Henry VIII, he was tall and handsome as a young man. Also like his grandson he was
pleasure-loving, and in his later years he was increasingly arbitrary and avaricious. Notwithstanding this, he
proved capable of creating a successful and highly personal monarchy which in many ways set the scene for
the Tudor monarchs who ruled throughout the sixteenth century through the bloodline of his eldest daughter,
Elizabeth. Cora L. Scofield's two volumes are a magisterial record of this reign. Although other biographies
have appeared, none have replaced this solid work of scholarship. In his authoritative and best-selling
biography of Edward IV in 1975, Professor Charles Ross said '. . . my attempt . . . has necessarily involved
some foreshortening, and for details one must still refer to Miss C. L. Scofield's elaborate . . . account of
Yorkist foreign policy.'
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From reader reviews:

Bill Underhill:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can help
individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Life and Reign of Edward the Fourth, King of
England and of France and Lord of Ireland: Volume 1 book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge.
Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Allison Carson:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading practice give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based
on what kind of e-book you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning
books but if you want experience happy read one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The The
Life and Reign of Edward the Fourth, King of England and of France and Lord of Ireland: Volume 1 is kind
of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Amanda Grant:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find guide that
need more time to be go through. The Life and Reign of Edward the Fourth, King of England and of France
and Lord of Ireland: Volume 1 can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short time
problems.

Kenneth Poor:

You will get this The Life and Reign of Edward the Fourth, King of England and of France and Lord of
Ireland: Volume 1 by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your
solve issue if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only through
written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just
looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways
to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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