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The iPhone, iPod touch, and iPad are not just consumer devices. Apple's popular iOS devices are rapidly
spreading through the business market in increasing numbers. In this thorough reference guide, IT
professionals will learn from seasoned IT veteran John Welch how to deploy and manage iOS devices in the
enterprise.
 
John uses a refreshing, straightforward approach to teach you how to manage iOS devices. And he covers a
wide range of methods, from managing just a handful of devices to dealing with hundreds. You'll find out
when using iTunes for management is good enough and how to get the most out of that simple tool. You'll
also explore what you can do with Apple's free iPhone Configuration Utility, from setting up applications
and provisioning to specifying precisely what users can do with their devices. He'll show you how to use the
iPCU (iPhone Configuration Utility) to install enterprise apps on an iOS device, do extensive management,
and distribute profiles via USB, by email, and over the air (OTA). For environments that require large
deployments with huge numbers of iOS devices, you'll get instruction on using SCEP (Simple Certificate
Enrollment Protocol). And he’ll take you even further to learn how to use Mobile Device Management
(MDM) to push changes out to devices.
 
This book includes:

A no-nonsense style of instruction from experienced IT professional and popular presenter John Welch●

Simple, clear explanations that make principles easy to apply to your own environment●

Insider tips to ensure success and avoid common problems●

The basics, including management with iTunes and iPCU (iPhone Configuration Utility)●

Advanced topics, such as server setup and wireless application distribution●
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From reader reviews:

Karen Lheureux:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled iOS 5 in the Enterprise (Develop and Design). Try to make the book
iOS 5 in the Enterprise (Develop and Design) as your friend. It means that it can for being your friend when
you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me
make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Hazel Fletcher:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take iOS 5 in the Enterprise (Develop and
Design) as your daily resource information.

Richard Graham:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this iOS 5 in the Enterprise (Develop and Design), you are able to tells your
family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make
them reading a e-book.

David Baxter:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love iOS 5 in the Enterprise (Develop and
Design), you may enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout people. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named
reading friends.
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