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Warren Felt Evans (1817–1889) converted to Methodism while at Dartmouth College, became a minister,
and spent his Methodist years as a spiritual seeker. His two extant journals, edited and annotated by
Catherine L. Albanese, appear in print for the first time and reveal the inner journey of a leading American
spiritual pilgrim at a critical period in his religious search. A voracious reader, he recorded accounts of
intense religious experience in his journals. He moved from the Oberlin perfectionism he embraced early on,
through the French quietism of Madame J. Guyon and Archbishop Fénelon, then into Swedenborgianism,
spiritualism, and mind cure with distinct theosophical overtones. His carefully documented journey is
suggestive of the similar journeys of the religious seekers who made their way into the burgeoning
metaphysical movement at the end of the 19th century—and may shed light too on today's spirituality.
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From reader reviews:

Billy Anderson:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of e-book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want
truly feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the The Spiritual
Journals of Warren Felt Evans: From Methodism to Mind Cure (Religion in North America) is kind of
reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Eldon Hall:

Often the book The Spiritual Journals of Warren Felt Evans: From Methodism to Mind Cure (Religion in
North America) has a lot associated with on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some research before write this
book. This particular book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this article book.

Donna Solano:

Exactly why? Because this The Spiritual Journals of Warren Felt Evans: From Methodism to Mind Cure
(Religion in North America) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the
item but latter it will surprise you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic
author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content interior easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the
other book have got such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want
to postpone having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Audra Yoder:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book The Spiritual Journals of Warren Felt Evans: From
Methodism to Mind Cure (Religion in North America) was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there.
As we know that book The Spiritual Journals of Warren Felt Evans: From Methodism to Mind Cure
(Religion in North America) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto
or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of
book tend to be make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best
book to suit your needs and try to like reading that will.
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