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Teenagers face numerous challenges as they make the transition from high school into adulthood, including
the challenge of maintaining a vibrant faith. The spiritual topics of childhood and adolescence morph into
new questions that often require deeper belief and understanding.

Ben Hardman, lead pastor of The Avenue in Louisville, Kentucky, offers insights and inspiration in the 30-
day devotional book Thrive: Do More Than Survive Your Faith. As a veteran of both youth ministry and
young adult/college ministry, Hardman has worked alongside teenagers as they make this transition to
adulthood and grapple with big issues and a new awareness of what it means to follow Christ.

Thrive will help teenagers explore some essential big-picture themes:

Decisions made now affect their future●

What idolatry is and how it still exists in our world●

Developing spiritual disciplines●

Journeying with God●

Understanding and living out the gospel●

Students will be challenged to embark on the adventure of exploring Scripture with fresh eyes, wrestling
with the impact of their choices and their tremendous need for wisdom, and putting their faith into action.
They'll learn more about the origins of Scripture, how mature Christians incorporate biblical truth into
every area of their lives, and how students can maintain a fresh faith even as they assume greater
responsibilities as young adults.

Help the teenagers in your life discover the excitement and joy of a deeper relationship with Jesus. They
don't have to just survive-they can thrive!
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From reader reviews:

James Bass:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great and important the book Thrive: Do More Than Survive Your Faith
(Simply for Students). All type of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Alex Levey:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lots of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is actually Thrive: Do More Than Survive Your Faith (Simply for Students).

Daryl Glover:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Thrive: Do More Than Survive Your
Faith (Simply for Students), you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it? What
kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its
named reading friends.

Mary Wright:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that filled update of news.
With this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in search
of the Thrive: Do More Than Survive Your Faith (Simply for Students) when you essential it?
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