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Blissfully shallow and carefree, Kate Chastain was your typical twenty something college co-ed. Well, until
reality gave her a wake-up call in the form of a diploma, that is. At a crossroads after graduation, a
serendipitous coincidence convinced Kate to abandon life as she knew it and jump feet first into the world of
working on mega yachts. At first, she stumbled her way through life as a stewardess, just trying to adjust to
her new surroundings and clumsily ‘learning the ropes’ via trial and error. Like shit-tons of error. But now,
nearly ten years and a hit reality show later, Kate is finally ready to share the good, the bad, and the
downright shocking details about her life at sea with the world’s most rich and famous. It was 2008 and we
were anchored off of St.Tropez. I had only been a yachtie for two seasons at the time when I turned to the
Captain’s wife, and said, “You know, I could write a book about all of insane things we see working on these
boats…..the sex, the money, the celebrities….” My older, more experienced coworker rolled her eyes and
laughed then was quick to dismiss my silly idea, “Kate, of course we could all write a book about what we
see on yachts. We’ve all said it for years…..but, if you actually did that, you would never get hired on
another yacht again. ” She went back to polishing the crystal wine glass in her hand and I was confused for a
second. “But Stacie, if so many people knew about the book that I couldn’t get a yacht job, would I still
really need one?”
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From reader reviews:

Louise Schmidt:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than
other is high. For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Lucky
Charming book as beginner and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Lillie Granado:

The guide with title Lucky Charming has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain
after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on
your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Norbert Walling:

The book untitled Lucky Charming contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the girl idea
with easy way. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can
easy to read it. The book was written by famous author. The author will take you in the new age of literary
works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so
you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you
can start their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice examine.

Jacquelynn Laverty:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This specific book Lucky Charming was multi-colored and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book Lucky Charming has many kinds or variety. Start from
kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you
are the character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and
unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading in which.
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