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As a Walker between worlds, Del is responsible for the love of her life—and the fate of millions—in this
thrilling sequel to Dissonance. As School Library Journal raves, “O’Rourke brilliantly builds an intricate
and complex alternate science-fiction universe…fans will be longing for the next installment.”

Del risked everything to save Simon, and now he’s gone, off in another world with no way for Del to find
him.

She’s back at the Consort—training to be a Walker like everyone in her family. But the Free Walkers have
other plans for her. This rebel group is trying to convince Del that the Consort is evil, and that her parents are
unwittingly helping the Consort kill millions of people. The Free Walkers make Del the ultimate promise: if
Del joins their fight, she will be reunited with Simon.

In agreeing, Del might be endangering her family. But if she doesn’t, innocent people will die, and Simon
will be lost to her forever. The fate of the multiverse depends on her choice...
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Hill:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Next to that
you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Resonance (Dissonance) will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of
you think in which open or reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are often
thought like that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable book with you?

Timothy Austin:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to complete others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question
because just their can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
right. Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Resonance (Dissonance) to read.

Nicholas Mishler:

This Resonance (Dissonance) book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your
hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information inside this book incredible fresh,
you will get data which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Resonance
(Dissonance) without we realize teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't become worry Resonance (Dissonance) can bring if you are and not make your tote space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This Resonance
(Dissonance) having very good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not experience
uninterested in reading.

Gary Spengler:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Resonance (Dissonance) can be the
reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this
brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?
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