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A concise, pocket-sized nursing reference, Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing, 9th Edition
includes all the facts and figures you’ll need to succeed in clinicals. The streamlined format organizes
content by body system, with tables, boxes, and bulleted lists that simplify searching. From definitions and
abbreviations to dosage calculations and lab values, this pocket guide presents the most up-to-date guidelines
and clinical information in an easy-to-use, quick-reference format!

Basic assessment by body system makes it easy to locate specific information.●

Concise, pocket-sized format ensures portability for use in the clinical setting.●

Basic facts and figures provide valuable background information.●

English-to-Spanish translations help you communicate with Spanish-speaking patients.●

Content is presented in tabular, list, and outline format for quick and easy retrieval.●

Chapter outlines with corresponding page numbers provide quick, easy access to information.●

NEW! The latest information on infection control, pressure ulcers, dietary guidelines, and more.●

NEW! Uses the latest NANDA-1 (2015-17), NIC, and NOC terminologies.●

UPDATED images serve as visual reinforcement throughout.●

NEW! Additional information for six QSEN competencies.●

UPDATED chapter bibliographies reference related sources for further in-depth study.●
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From reader reviews:

Diane Dean:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring that you imagine the story how
the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e, you may tells your family, friends and
soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Herman Deans:

Beside this specific Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e in your phone, it
may give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you can
got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in
narrow town. It is good thing to have Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e
because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you don't
get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss
it? Find this book as well as read it from currently!

Kim Salgado:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This guide Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e was
filled about science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has various feel when they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you
can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you just
wanted.

Mathew Casillas:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Clinical Companion for Fundamentals
of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e to make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability
is developing when you like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle
the feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to start a book and



study it. Beside that the e-book Clinical Companion for Fundamentals of Nursing: Just the Facts, 9e can to
be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of that time.
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