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"The enemy on whom we declare war is capital, and it is against capital that we will direct all our
efforts, taking care not to become distracted from our goal by the phony campaigns and arguments of
the political parties. The great struggle that we are preparing for is essentially economic, and so it is on
the economic terrain that we should focus our activities." —Peter Kropotkin

Peter Kropotkin is by far anarchism’s most influential theorist, and Direct Struggle Against Capital is the
most extensive collection of his writings available in English. Over half the selections have been translated
for the first time or recovered from long-out-of-print pamphlets and newspapers. The result is a volume that
provides an introduction to classic texts, while showing new facets of a familiar and canonical figure. Direct
Struggle Against Capital paints a detailed portrait of Kropotkin the revolutionary, the man Emma Goldman
described as someone for whom anarchism “was not an ideal for the select few. It was a constructive social
theory, destined to usher in a new world for all of mankind.”

Fully annotated and featuring a lengthy historical introduction, biographical sketch, glossary, bibliography,
and index.

Peter Kropotkin (1842—1921) was one of anarchism's most famous thinkers. His classic works include
Conquest of Bread; Fields, Factories and Workshops; Memoirs of a Revolutionist; and Mutual Aid: A Factor
of Evolution.

Iain McKay is author of An Anarchist FAQ (volumes 1 & 2) and Property Is Theft: A Pierre-Joseph
Proudhon Anthology.
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca Burks:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching
TV, or playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can
spent 24 hours a day to reading a book. The book Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin
Anthology it is very good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. They were
enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual
e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive
but this book provides high quality.

Myra Coronado:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book way, more simple and reachable. This particular Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin
Anthology can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have matter that
they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by
knowing more than various other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have
Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin Anthology.

Arthur McLaurin:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by online on social media. You
can choose the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
identified as of book Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin Anthology. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make a person happier to
read. It is most significant that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to other
place.

David Perrin:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose the book Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin
Anthology to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the idea about book
and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and read it. Beside that the
book Direct Struggle Against Capital: A Peter Kropotkin Anthology can to be your brand new friend when
you're feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of these time.
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