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And the winner is...JOE GRIMM! He scored 24 KOs in a row and was never knocked out. He was a winner
in the ring, and a winner in life. This is the story of a bantam boxer, his chaperoning older brother, and the
time in which they lived. It is the 1920s, and there are boxing clubs in nearly every city in America. Joe
Grimm weighs 118 pounds and is flat-footed-but he has a punch and a KO record that draw leading
managers to add Joe to their stables. He trains in the same gym as Jim Braddock, the future Cinderella Man.
Joe's awesome winning streak is interrupted when he and his brother are called home. He leaves the arenas
with their cheering crowds and works as a butcher in his grocery shop bought with ring money for his
family. Now the character traits that made him a boxing wonder make him a success in business. The
Gentleman Boxer captures the excitement and hope of an era when anything was possible and anyone could
become a hero-or a champion. It is a tribute to the thousands of forgotten bantam prizefighters in the Golden
Age of Boxing.
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From reader reviews:

Gene Kirkland:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you should have this The Gentleman Boxer: The Story of a Fighter in the Roaring Twenties.

Keiko Whitchurch:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Next
to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book The Gentleman Boxer: The Story of a
Fighter in the Roaring Twenties will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if
you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book
make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you in search of best
book or acceptable book with you?

Pamela Acuna:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend
on what sorts of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel,
comics, and also soon. The The Gentleman Boxer: The Story of a Fighter in the Roaring Twenties offer you
a new experience in reading a book.

Kari Annis:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just trying to find the The Gentleman Boxer: The Story of a Fighter in the Roaring Twenties when you
necessary it?
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