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Simply sexy: Richard Kern's gloriously natural girls Richard Kern likes real women: unpretentious,
unadorned, and definitely undressed. Those who love Kern know each book is an invitation to join him in his
privileged world where natural young women share their most intimate moments. Richard has never lost his
boyish curiosity with girls and their secrets, so instead of posing them in sterile sets he follows them through
the house?or rather his New York apartment?from backyard to kitchen to bathroom to bedroom, capturing
every sexy and embarrassing moment. Action is his most revealing book yet. For 280 pages we careen
through the life of Kern, accompanied by dozens of energetic, fun-loving, clothes-dropping exhibitionists.
?Young women want to show the world they?re not like their man-hating women's lib mothers, ? a Kern
model once told me, and these girls certainly get the point across. To further assist the young ladies in their
rebellion, the book includes an hour-long DVD of original Kern film with an exclusive musical score by
Thurston Moore of Sonic Youth. Way to stick it to the Mom, ladies! And thank you, Richard, you lucky dog.
- Dian Hanson The artist: Richard Kern was born in North Carolina in 1954 and has lived and worked in
New York City since 1979. In the ?80s, he produced a series of short films that now are recognized as the
central works of the movement known as the Cinema of Transgression. In the ?90s he switched to still
photography full time and occasionally directed music videos for bands including Sonic Youth and Marilyn
Manson. Kern has published nine books and is a regular contributor to a variety of international publications.
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From reader reviews:

Alyson Hardy:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled Action (Book & DVD). Try to stumble through book Action (Book
& DVD) as your close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside that
course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you more
confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

Rhonda Yowell:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Action (Book & DVD). You can choose the best book if
you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book Action (Book &
DVD). You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due
to the fact from book you can realize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a book or
even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel fed up to go to the
library. Let's learn.

Carol Hamilton:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or data even knowledge to make
all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
you is you don't know what one you should start with. This Action (Book & DVD) is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jose Johnson:

Action (Book & DVD) can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her
effort that will put every word into joy arrangement in writing Action (Book & DVD) but doesn't forget the
main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe you can be among
it. This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial pondering.
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