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Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets is a completely updated and redesigned edition of the popular children's
book formerly titled 'Philip's Atlas of Stars and Planets'. Written specially for 8 to 14 year olds, Philip's
Exploring Stars and Planets is a colourful and entertaining introduction to the exciting world of astronomy.
The book is illustrated with more than 200 colour photographs, artworks and maps, as the author describes
the latest developments in the fast-moving fields of space exploration and astronomy. Concise chapters
introduce the Sun, the Earth and all the other planets in our Solar System. Then, moving further into space,
the author introduces the stars and galaxies, and explores the origin of the Universe.Philip's Exploring Stars
and Planets includes a set of star charts showing all the stars visible to the naked eye. A budding astronomer
will be able to use these charts to learn the constellations from any point on Earth. A large photograph of the
Moon, with its major features clearly labelled, will encourage anyone with binoculars or a telescope to start
Moon-watching.Packed with fascinating facts and figures about the wonders of the Universe, Philip's
Exploring Stars and Planets concludes with a series of quiz questions, so that the reader can test how much
he or she has learned.
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From reader reviews:

Evan Hinson:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question because
just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets to
read.

Rosemarie Cleveland:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word
written in a e-book then become one form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get
previous to. The Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets giving you an additional experience more than blown
away your mind but also giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us show you
the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished studying it, like
winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Ross Larson:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets can be
the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Willa Killeen:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets can give you
a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you have issue that they don't and make a person more
like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than other make you to be great men
and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have Philip's Exploring Stars and Planets.
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