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100 recipes that teach you how to perform various machine learning tasks in the real world

About This Book

Understand which algorithms to use in a given context with the help of this exciting recipe-based guide●

Learn about perceptrons and see how they are used to build neural networks●

Stuck while making sense of images, text, speech, and real estate? This guide will come to your rescue,●

showing you how to perform machine learning for each one of these using various techniques

Who This Book Is For

This book is for Python programmers who are looking to use machine-learning algorithms to create real-
world applications. This book is friendly to Python beginners, but familiarity with Python programming
would certainly be useful to play around with the code.

What You Will Learn

Explore classification algorithms and apply them to the income bracket estimation problem●

Use predictive modeling and apply it to real-world problems●

Understand how to perform market segmentation using unsupervised learning●

Explore data visualization techniques to interact with your data in diverse ways●

Find out how to build a recommendation engine●

Understand how to interact with text data and build models to analyze it●

Work with speech data and recognize spoken words using Hidden Markov Models●

Analyze stock market data using Conditional Random Fields●

Work with image data and build systems for image recognition and biometric face recognition●

Grasp how to use deep neural networks to build an optical character recognition system●

In Detail

Machine learning is becoming increasingly pervasive in the modern data-driven world. It is used extensively
across many fields such as search engines, robotics, self-driving cars, and more.

With this book, you will learn how to perform various machine learning tasks in different environments.
We'll start by exploring a range of real-life scenarios where machine learning can be used, and look at
various building blocks. Throughout the book, you'll use a wide variety of machine learning algorithms to
solve real-world problems and use Python to implement these algorithms.

You'll discover how to deal with various types of data and explore the differences between machine learning
paradigms such as supervised and unsupervised learning. We also cover a range of regression techniques,
classification algorithms, predictive modeling, data visualization techniques, recommendation engines, and
more with the help of real-world examples.



Style and approach

You will explore various real-life scenarios in this book where machine learning can be used, and learn about
different building blocks of machine learning using independent recipes in the book.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Parrish:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Python Machine Learning Cookbook book
as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Dominique Rigney:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people do it
anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this Python
Machine Learning Cookbook, it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours reserve.
Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Lynn Lambert:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get great deal of
stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely indeed.
People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is
Python Machine Learning Cookbook.

Anita Rodriguez:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Python Machine Learning
Cookbook to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression
about book and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and read it. Beside
that the guide Python Machine Learning Cookbook can to be your friend when you're truly feel alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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