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“I like your buttons, Mrs. Sutton-Jones!” Kind words can be contagious. Cassandra’s simple compliment to
her teacher starts off a chain reaction of kindness through the teachers and students at school, adults at work,
and families at home. Soon, the entire neighborhood is in a good mood! Cassandra’s kindheartedness comes
full circle when her father comes home with a surprise, which Cassandra inadvertently helped happen. Learn
how quickly kind words can spread and how easy it is to be a nice person, all while learning a new language!

Reviews

“What goes around, comes around—literally, figuratively, every which way in this do-good, feel-good title.”
- Kirkus

“This simple but compelling story teaches children that a smile and a kind word gives people a sense of pride
in themselves and a desire to do something nice for others.” - Children’s Literature Review

“The cartoon-style art has lots of vigor and features a multiethnic community that is linked by good will.” -
Booklist

About Babl Books
Babl Books partners with award winning authors to bring your favorite books to a variety of new languages
for children all over the world to enjoy. Our bilingual books bring generations closer together through
reading and language, help teachers connect with their students in their own language, and give children all
over the world access to books they never would have access to. Babl Books is dedicated to overcoming
language barriers that separate readers and great authors. The hassle is over in finding a remarkable, high
quality bilingual children’s book.
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From reader reviews:

Willard Sarvis:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide I Like Your Buttons! / ¡Me gustan tus botones!: Babl
Children's Books in Spanish and English will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel considerably
more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading any book
make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best
book or suited book with you?

Lisa Walker:

This book untitled I Like Your Buttons! / ¡Me gustan tus botones!: Babl Children's Books in Spanish and
English to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you
can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail outlet or you can
order it through online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book,
as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this publication
from your list.

Sara Matthews:

The reason? Because this I Like Your Buttons! / ¡Me gustan tus botones!: Babl Children's Books in Spanish
and English is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will
distress you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write
the book in such awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still
convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going
to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help
improving your skill and your critical thinking way. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I have
been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Martha Fincher:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This I Like Your Buttons! / ¡Me gustan tus
botones!: Babl Children's Books in Spanish and English can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you
know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is common not
a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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