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Convenient 4"x6" mini book size, perfect for on-the-go coloring●

48 unique hand-drawn flowers and swirling, floral-themed mandalas to color●

Images printed on only one side of the page- no bleed-through!●

Take part in the adult coloring book craze that is sweeping the nation!
Roses are red.
Violets are blue.
Kids like to color,
And grown-ups do, too!

This little pocket-sized book (4"x6") is the perfect size for coloring during a work break, on the bus, or in the
back of a lecture hall (did we say that out loud?).

48 beautiful flowery illustrations bloom inside, ranging from pansies to irises to dandelions, to made-up
fantasy flowers (we like to call them rejects from God's suggestion box).

Coloring is a meditative hobby enjoyed by people of all ages. Our favorite tools to color with are colored
pencils, but you can also use crayons, oil pastels, markers, or colored pens. If you are saturating the page
with markers, though, you might want to put an extra blank paper or two under your drawing- just in case!
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Lord:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover. Try to stumble
through book Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover as your close friend. It means that it
can to get your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is
very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every thing by
the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Carla Spiegel:

This Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover book is not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book will be information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover without we realize teach the one who
looking at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Pocket Full of Posies: A
Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover can bring if you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves'
become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Pocket Full of Posies: A
Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Anna Raynor:

The guide untitled Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover is the e-book that recommended
to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you. The language that
article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when
write the book, to ensure the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also
could get the e-book of Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover from the publisher to make
you considerably more enjoy free time.

Henry Jones:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is
definitely Pocket Full of Posies: A Tiny Book of Flowers to Cover.
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