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What’s your number? Are you a musical 2? A young-at-heart 3?  Or a brilliant 12? Find out with Titania’s
Book of Numerology.

Numerology doesn't make you what you are, but it is a wonderful symbolic language which helps you to
understand yourself and others.  All the calculations you need to unravel your own personality, your lover's
inclinations, your chances of compatibility in a relationship, and your future can be derived easily from your
birth date - and here Titania will show you how. 

Just as Titania Hardie offers a woman-centered, modern interpretation of the I Ching in Good Fortune and
how to attract it, here she offers a feminist interpretation of numerology. "The welcome arrival of the number
2 in the new millennium embraces a more sharing, feminine ideal of cooperation," she writes.  Shonagh
Rae's funky, urban-inspired illustrations and intense color choices evoke the energy of graffiti, reinforcing
the book's fresh, contemporary appearance.

Each chapter of this book looks in depth at one number, its properties if it is a Day Force or Birth Force, how
it can help you understand those you have relationships with, and what kind of experiences you will have in
the future. 
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From reader reviews:

Rita Hackett:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Titania's Book of Numerology as your daily resource
information.

Terry Crabtree:

Titania's Book of Numerology can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocabulary,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article author giving his/her
effort to place every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Titania's Book of Numerology nevertheless
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be one among it. This great information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

John Mendoza:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Titania's Book of Numerology is
simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess
much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you simpler to read
it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.

Donna Willeford:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
And you know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something
by book. Different categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims
Titania's Book of Numerology.
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