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In every traveler's mind exists the perfect little out-of-the-way inn where the bread is always fresh-baked and
the beds are downright heavenly. And where the soup is gratifying, gutsy, and downright gratifying.

Since 1981, Crescent Dragonwagon-noted children's book author, cookbook writer, and innkeeper-has
owned that perfect little inn: Dairy Hollow House in Eureka Springs, Arkansas.

Distilling all her soup-making, bread-baking and salad-mixing wisdom into one book, Crescent
Dragonwagon presents 200 of the recipes that have made her inn a many-time winner of the Uncle Ben's
Best Inn of the Year Award. Here are the pedigreed soups: Winter Borscht . la Vielle Russe, Cuban Black
Bean Soup. Soups with a twist: Fishysoisse, Gazpacho Rosa, New World Corn Chowder. Soups to warm you
up: Deep December Cream of Root Soup. And soups to cool you down: Chilled Avocado Soup, Mexique
Bay, Orange Blossom Special. Plus dozens of fabulous breads, from Slightly Fanatic Whole-Grain Dream
Bread to Rosemary Foccacia Dairy Hollow, and salads, including Beet and Apple Salad on Mixed Greens.
Selection of the Book-of-the-Month Club's HomeStyle Books and Better Homes & Gardens Family Book
Service. Over 267,000 copies in print.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Payne:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Dairy Hollow House Soup & Bread Cookbook why because the amazing
cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content
will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.

Helen Leduc:

The book untitled Dairy Hollow House Soup & Bread Cookbook contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very straightforward all the people, so
do not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read more your smart
phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice examine.

Johnnie Colby:

You may spend your free time to see this book this book. This Dairy Hollow House Soup & Bread
Cookbook is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did
not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.

Ethel Swafford:

You may get this Dairy Hollow House Soup & Bread Cookbook by go to the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of
this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In
the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right
now, choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself
to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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