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The Elan was built on a backbone-type chassis, to which was added a GRP body shell, which was strong
enough to pass the tests demanded by the new US regulations in 1968. It had disc brakes all-round and the
famous 1558cc twin-cam Lotus engine in various states of tune. The original S1 introduced in 1962 lasted
until 1964. The S2 had bigger front brakes and centre-lock wheels. The S3 from 1966 had electric windows
and a close-ration gearbox option. This series also brought the SE model with more power. The S4 came in
1968 with wider wheel arches and the 128bhp Sprint came in 1971. This is a book of contemporary road and
comparison tests, technical and specification data, new model introductions, driver' s impressions, racing,
history. Models covered include:- Series 1, 2, 3, 4 & S4 Sprint, Plus2, Plus 2S.
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From reader reviews:

Ricky Copeland:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Lotus Elan 1962-1974 Ultimate Portfolio. Try to make the book
Lotus Elan 1962-1974 Ultimate Portfolio as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you
feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you
personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let
us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Janelle Smith:

This book untitled Lotus Elan 1962-1974 Ultimate Portfolio to be one of several books this best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
particular book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone.
So there is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Lisa Knight:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try
to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them
is this Lotus Elan 1962-1974 Ultimate Portfolio.

Ann Morgan:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This guide Lotus Elan 1962-1974 Ultimate Portfolio was filled about science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading any book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-
book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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