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• The official guidebook to the Windsor Castle
• Illustrated with 130 color images including paintings, drawings, works of art, historic documents and
beautiful photographs of the State Rooms

These new, fully revised official souvenir guides, published in partnership with the Royal Collection to mark
the Diamond Jubilee, include titles on the magnificent palaces and residences, on the finest working stables
in existence, on the largest dolls house in the world and on the enthralling history of the royal line of
succession. Written by specialist authors including the curators of the Royal Collection, beautifully
illustrated and containing details of the works of art, the architecture, stories of occupants, photographs and
plans, each book gives a fascinating insight into these famous sites, their history and contents.

Windsor Castle, the largest and oldest occupied castle in the world, is one of the official residences of Her
Majesty The Queen. The Castle's dramatic site encapsulates over 900 years of British history. It covers an
area of 26 acres and contains, as well as a royal palace, the magnificent St George's Chapel and the homes
and workplaces of a large number of people. This fully illustrated official souvenir guide details the history
of the Castle from its founder, William the Conqueror, to the present day, including the fire of 1992 and the
superb restoration of the damaged rooms, and presents a beautifully illustrated tour of the Castle, including
the State Apartments and Semi-State Apartments and their treasures.
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From reader reviews:

Marvin Seto:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide
will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some
of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they may be
thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suitable book with you?

Katherine Clark:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important normally. The book Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide had been making
you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for
you. The guide Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide is not only giving you much more new information
but also being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your
guide. Try to make relationship using the book Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide. You never truly
feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Colin Wegner:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top
listing in your reading list will be Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide. This book which is qualified as
The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and review this
book you can get many advantages.

Betty Patton:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also native
or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. Through the
book Windsor Castle: Official Souvenir Guide we can have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be
creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book that
suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this time book Windsor Castle: Official
Souvenir Guide. You can more desirable than now.
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