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Generations of scholars have debated the influence of Greco-Roman culture on Jewish society and the degree
of its impact on Jewish material culture and religious practice in Palestine and the Diaspora of antiquity.
Judaism and Hellenism in Antiquity examines this phenomenon from the aftermath of Alexander’s conquest
to the Byzantine era, offering a balanced view of the literary, epigraphical, and archeological evidence
attesting to the process of Hellenization in Jewish life and its impact on several aspects of Judaism as we
know it today.

Lee Levine approaches this broad subject in three essays, each focusing on diverse issues in Jewish culture:
Jerusalem at the end of the Second Temple period, rabbinic tradition, and the ancient synagogue. With his
comprehensive and thorough knowledge of the intricate dynamics of the Jewish and Greco-Roman societies,
the author demonstrates the complexities of Hellenization and its role in shaping many aspects of Jewish
life?economic, social, political, cultural, and religious. He argues against oversimplification and encourages
a more nuanced view, whereby the Jews of antiquity survived and prospered, despite the social and political
upheavals of this era, emerging as perpetuators of their own Jewish traditions while open to change from the
outside world.
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From reader reviews:

Kerri Goodman:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read
one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Judaism and Hellenism in
Antiquity: Conflict or Confluence? (Samuel and Althea Stroum Lectures in Jewish Studies) is kind of
publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Violet Shook:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their particular friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want
to consider look for book, may be the book untitled Judaism and Hellenism in Antiquity: Conflict or
Confluence? (Samuel and Althea Stroum Lectures in Jewish Studies) can be excellent book to read. May be
it may be best activity to you.

Jacqueline Thompson:

Precisely why? Because this Judaism and Hellenism in Antiquity: Conflict or Confluence? (Samuel and
Althea Stroum Lectures in Jewish Studies) is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you
to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic
author who also write the book in such wonderful way makes the content on the inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book
get such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold up having
that book? If I had been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Sherri Ellison:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know
that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your own
teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. Different categories of books
that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims Judaism and Hellenism in Antiquity:
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