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So you're leading a small group? Your small group can accomplish big things in the lives of your teenagers.
And in Help! I'm a Small-Group Leader! you'll find methods and approaches you can use. Foibles and
minefields to avoid. Solutions and tips that will help you nurture your small group into a growing
community, whatever you goals. Inside you'll discover -- How to put small groups together - How NOT to
lead a small group - How to start a discussion -- and KEEP IT GOING - How to ASK QUESTIONS that get
responses - Three kinds of BIBLE STUDY questions to ask - How to work with DIFFERENT personalities
in a small group - How to help you kids LEARN TO PRAY - 10 ideas for BUILDING COMMUNITY in
your small group . . . and to top it off are 20 pages of questions (100 questions, to be exact) that you can use
in your small group Bible study, on the most common subjects discussed in junior and senior high small
groups. All this in a no-frills, straight-to-the-point style -- perfect for volunteer small-group leaders, or for
youth pastors or youth directors to lead their staffs through.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Smith:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Help! I'm a Small-Group Leader!. You can choose the best
book if you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Help! I'm
a Small-Group Leader!. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, since from book you can realize everything! From your country until finally foreign or
abroad you may be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era,
we can easily open a book or even searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You may use it when you
feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Laura Burnham:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book Help! I'm a Small-Group Leader! will make
you to end up being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about almost everything.
But some of you think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they
might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Gail Delamora:

This book untitled Help! I'm a Small-Group Leader! to be one of several books this best seller in this year,
that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this book in
the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to
you personally to past this book from your list.

Robert Rascoe:

The book Help! I'm a Small-Group Leader! has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a
lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research before
write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point easily after scanning this book.
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