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Laser shock peening (LSP) is a relatively new surface treatment for metallic materials. LSP is a process to
induce compressive residual stresses using shock waves generated by laser pulses. LSP can greatly improve
the resistance of a material to crack initiation and propagation brought on by cyclic loading and fatigue. This
pioneering book was the first of its kind to consolidate scattered knowledge into one comprehensive volume.
It describes the mechanisms of LSP and its substantial role in improving fatigue performance in terms of
modification of microstructure, surface morphology, hardness and strength. In particular it describes
numerical simulation techniques and procedures which can be adopted by engineers and research scientists
to design, evaluate and optimise LSP processes in practical applications.

Provides for the first time, a comprehensive coverage of this important area●

Written by two world renowned experts●
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From reader reviews:

Carol Welch:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something
that they don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Laser Shock Peening:
Performance and Process Simulation (Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and Surface Engineering). All
type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Florence Croy:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When
you study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Laser Shock Peening: Performance and Process Simulation (Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and
Surface Engineering) provide you with a new experience in reading through a book.

Lidia Hill:

This Laser Shock Peening: Performance and Process Simulation (Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and
Surface Engineering) is completely new way for you who has attention to look for some information since it
relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or you who
still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Laser Shock Peening: Performance and Process Simulation
(Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and Surface Engineering) can be the light food in your case because
the information inside this book is easy to get by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is
reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication form
make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a book especially
this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss the item!
Just read this e-book kind for your better life and knowledge.

Vera Pinckney:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That Laser Shock Peening: Performance and Process
Simulation (Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and Surface Engineering) can give you a lot of good
friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have thing that they don't and make anyone more
like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer
you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than other make you to be great



individuals. So , why hesitate? Let me have Laser Shock Peening: Performance and Process Simulation
(Woodhead Publishing Series in Metals and Surface Engineering).
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