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Ever wondered why our towns and villages are so named? Were they a deliberate creation by our ancestors
or did they evolve naturally over time? Which river was named from the blackberries which grow there?
Why would a rock be called the Pig's Nose? What links beer and cathedrals? Why is Mincing Lake not a lake
but a river? And just who were Peter and Mary Tavy? In these pages we examine the origins of the names
with which we are otherwise so familiar. Towns, villages, districts, hills, streams, woods, farms, fields,
streets and even pubs are examined and explained. The definitions are supported by anecdotal evidence,
bringing to life the individuals and events which have influenced the places and the way these names have
developed. This is not just a dictionary, but a history too, and will prove invaluable not only for those who
live and work in the county but also to visitors and tourists, historians and former inhabitants, indeed anyone
with an interest in South Devon.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Brill:

This South Devon Place Names tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person,
why. The main reason of this South Devon Place Names can be one of the great books you must have will be
giving you more than just simple examining food but feed you with information that probably will shock
your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions in the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this South Devon Place Names forcing you to have an
enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we all know it useful
in your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Denise Dennis:

This book untitled South Devon Place Names to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this
particular book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there
is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.

Christopher Suttle:

The particular book South Devon Place Names will bring one to the new experience of reading some sort of
book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very
suitable to you. The book South Devon Place Names is much recommended to you you just read. You can
also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Sharon Baker:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its handle may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer could be South Devon Place Names why because the wonderful cover
that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is usually
fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this
book.
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