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Everything you need to know about traveling and camping safely in bear country

· Practical strategies for avoiding dangerous situations—and how to cope if you do encounter a bear
· Debunks commonly held myths about people and bears
· Revised edition highlights new research and new issues

No more myths. No more rumors. No more horror stories. Backcountry Bear Basics, 2nd Edition provides
tested strategies to help you avoid conflict with black bears and grizzlies.

Bear expert Dave Smith gives you the basics—like how to choose a good campsite and properly store your
food so that you don’t have to worry whether that pepper spray you brought will work on the bear that
wanders into camp. He debunks commonly held myths about people and bears. For instance, menstruating
women don’t have to stay out of bear country, he says. And no, don’t roll up in a ball when faced with a
charging bear. So much of conventional wisdom about bears is often just plain bad advice; Smith tells you
what you should do instead and why. He also reviews specific outdoor activities—from fishing to mountain
biking to hiking with young children to trail running—assessing the likelihood of bear encounters and
suggesting tactics for coping in different settings and situations.

This updated second edition incorporates new research (Do bear bells work? Does tent color or shape make a
difference in attracting bears?) and adds more charts and sidebars to make material accessible at a glance.
Smith provides key information on bear behavior and biology to help you understand, rather than fear, this
most misunderstood animal.
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Salamanca:

This Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant Encounters (Mountaineers
Outdoor Basics) are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The reason of this
Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant Encounters (Mountaineers Outdoor
Basics) can be on the list of great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple reading
food but feed you with information that probably will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is definitely
handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed types.
Beside that this Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant Encounters
(Mountaineers Outdoor Basics) giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
test of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Joe Bell:

This book untitled Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant Encounters
(Mountaineers Outdoor Basics) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is because
when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the
book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to
you to past this e-book from your list.

Fern Barron:

This Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant Encounters (Mountaineers
Outdoor Basics) is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information given it relief your
hunger associated with. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having bit of digest in reading this Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant
Encounters (Mountaineers Outdoor Basics) can be the light food for yourself because the information inside
this kind of book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in the form which is reachable by
anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book form make them feel
tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can
find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book type
for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Jack Michaud:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart
and soul or real their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to
right now there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along



with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself.
As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Backcountry Bear Basics: The Definitive Guide to Avoiding Unpleasant
Encounters (Mountaineers Outdoor Basics) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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