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Arguably the most important American composer of the century, Elliott Carter often has been more highly
regarded in Europe than in his native land. Interest in his work has grown rapidly in recent years, however,
and the celebration of his ninetieth birthday in December, 1998, accompanied by numerous performances
and new recordings, undoubtedly will increase the attention of his fellow citizens to this remarkable
figure.Authoritative and gracefully written, The Music of Elliott Carter engages composers, performers, and
critics, and speaks to concert-goers, whether attuned to or alarmed by the formidable difficulty of Carter's
music. David Schiff views the music from the perspective of the composer's development and relates his
compositional techniques to those nonmusical arts?contemporary American poetry in particular?with which
Carter has been deeply involved. The volume benefits from Schiff's extensive discussions of Carter's works
with their most noted performers, including Heinz Holliger, Oliver Knussen, and Ursula Oppens, and from
the generous cooperation of the composer himself.This new edition, a thoroughly reorganized, revised, and
updated version of the book published in 1983, accounts for the many new works written by Carter since
1980 and accommodates the burgeoning critical literature on his music. Its features include many musical
examples and a selected discography. In addition to the new foreword, the composer has provided his listing
of three-to-six note chords and a note on "Voyage."
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From reader reviews:

Pearlie Henry:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide The Music of Elliott Carter will make
you to be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you
think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they
can be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suitable book with you?

William Medellin:

This The Music of Elliott Carter book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this publication incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That
The Music of Elliott Carter without we realize teach the one who examining it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry The Music of Elliott Carter can bring once you are and not
make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even
mobile phone. This The Music of Elliott Carter having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will
not feel uninterested in reading.

Stacey Eades:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info. When
you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this
The Music of Elliott Carter, you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge
can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Carolyn Rolon:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the data
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this The Music
of Elliott Carter.
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