
Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at
the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells

Patrick Weber

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=3832540237
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=3832540237
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=3832540237


Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the trans-
Golgi network of mammalian cells

Patrick Weber

Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells Patrick
Weber
In this thesis simulation models have been developed and validated to investigate the protein-lipid interaction
mechanisms at the trans-Golgi network (TGN) of mammalian cells. In two systems biological studies,
ordinary differential equation models were used to examine the interactions between the lipids involved in
the sphingomyelin synthase 1 reaction at the TGN and the proteins involved in the regulation of non-
vesicular Endoplasmic reticulum to TGN ceramide transfer. These systems include the lipids ceramide,
phosphatidyl choline, diacylglycerol and sphingomyelin and the proteins protein kinase D (PKD),
phosphatidyl inositol-4-kinase III ss and ceramide transfer protein (CERT), respectively.

The final results comprise a quantitative model of this network, and a comparison of competing hypotheses
regarding the mechanism of ceramide transfer. Major biological findings are that PKD and CERT work
together in a cooperative manner to perform ceramide transfer by forming a positive feedback regulation.
Important methodological side results of this thesis are a novel absolute quantification scheme for proteins
via Western Blot data and a Bayesian experiment design method.
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From reader reviews:

George Lehman:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the
trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells. Try to stumble through book Data-driven modeling of molecular
interactions at the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells as your buddy. It means that it can to get your
friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah,
it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Linda Mays:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a reserve. Book
has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions
at the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells will make you to always be smarter. You can feel a lot more
confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading the book
make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you looking for best book
or acceptable book with you?

Antonia Parham:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to test look for book, may be the guide untitled Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the
trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells can be great book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Ronald Jackson:

Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells can be one of
your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good
vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in
writing Data-driven modeling of molecular interactions at the trans-Golgi network of mammalian cells
although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts
that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn you into new stage of crucial thinking.
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