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The Blackfriars Theatre, founded in 1940, was one of New York's first Off-Broadway playhouses. It was
unique in another way: it was started by two Catholic priests and was the only professional level theatre in
the United States under Roman Catholic auspices. It was the first such theatrical venture by any religious
group. God Off-Broadway examines the efforts of the Blackfriars staff to meld theatre and religion between
1940 and 1972. While not as commercially successful as the founders had hoped it would be, Blackfriars
contributed in many other ways to the American theatrical tradition. The first play ever to move from Off-
Broadway to Broadway (Career Angel, 1945) was a Blackfriars production. Blackfriars also started and
showcased many young performers who later went on to successful careers, among them: Shelley Berman,
Anthony Franciosa, Eileen Heckart, Darren McGavin, Patricia Neal, and Geraldine Page. Although by the
late 1960s the company was reduced to producing routine religious dramas and innocuous family comedies,
daring and innovation characterized the early years of the theatre. Blackfriars took artistic and social risks in
the 1940s by producing plays about racial justice.

Powell based the book on primary sources, including Blackfriars archives and interviews with Blackfriars
veterans. Playwright Robert Anderson, who had his New York debut at Blackfriars, contributes an
introduction to the book. In addition to a complete chronological treatment of the theatre group, the author
provides a survey of the relationship of the Catholic Church and the theatre in America. Eighteen black and
white photographs complement the text.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Tirrell:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New
York. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. So long as we know about how is important
a new book God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York. You can add information and of
course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple matter
until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or even searching by internet
device. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

James Jones:

This God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York book is just not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this reserve
incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. That
God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York without we comprehend teach the one who
reading through it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry God Off-Broadway :
The Blackfriars Theatre of New York can bring once you are and not make your case space or bookshelves'
grow to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This God Off-Broadway
: The Blackfriars Theatre of New York having fine arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Otis Key:

The event that you get from God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York is the more deep you
excavating the information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does
not mean that this book is hard to know but God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York
giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-known enough.
This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then
can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having that
God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars Theatre of New York instantly.

Mildred Kershner:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This God Off-Broadway : The Blackfriars
Theatre of New York is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If
you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make
you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when one buys this book.
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